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• What do an historians do all day? An introduction to 
history and the careers it can lead to.

• What was the Norman Conquest and what impact did it 
have?

• The causes and consequences of the Black Death 1348

• What happened when monarchs tried to take control of 
the church? 

• The causes and consequences of the English Civil War 
1642-46

• Exploration and empire building, causes and 
consequences

• What was the Transatlantic Slave Trade and how was it 
abolished c1770’s-1830’s? A study of causation and the 
experiences of those enslaved, with an indepth look at 
the  abolition of both the slave trade and slavery in the 
Britsh empire.

• What role did individuals play in the development of 
Great Britian?

• Why did World War One break out and what was it like 
for those who fought in it? A study of causation and the 
experiences  of Europeans and colonial troops in the 
trenches.

• Did the US civil rights movement bring freedom for 
African Americans? A study in AA experiences in the US

• USA Civil Rights 1865-1992, the study of the civil rights 
of Native Americans, African Americans. 

• Russia 1894-1941, a study in the autocracy of Tsar 
Nicholas to the dictatorship of Stalin

• Britain 1603-1660, a study the Stuart monarchs James I 
and Charles I.

• USA Civil Rights 1865-1992, the study of the civil rights 
of  women and workers. 

• Russia 1894-1941, a study in the autocracy of Tsar 
Nicholas to the dictatorship of Stalin

• Britain 1603-1660, a study of the English Civil War and 
the rise of Oliver Cromwell and restoration

• The Twentieth Century

• Why did the Treaty of Versailles fail to bring about world 
peace?

• Why did Russia move from autocracy to dictatorship 
1894-1940?

• Causes, events and consequences of the Cold War 1945-
1990, including thedDropping of the atomic bombs and 
the Vietnam War

• The rise of international terrorism, 9/11

• A study of the Holocaust, causes and expeirences

• Elizabeth I, 1568-1603, a contintaion of this topic that 
will include the study of a Historiac Environment, for 
Example Hard wick Hall

• Power and the People 1170-c2000 an overview topic 
that looks at the development of power in Britain - the 
journey from monarchy to democracy.

• Conflict and Tension 1918-1939, a study of the interwar 
years with a focus on the causation of World War Two

• Germany 1890-1945, an indepth study of Germany 
that will focus on the impact of World War One, the 
development of democracy and the rise of the Nazis.

• Elizabeth I, 1568-1603, a indepth look at what it was like 
for a single woman ruling alone in a mans world.


